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OPINION  

{*182} STATEMENT OF THE CASE.  

{1} This cause comes to this court on appeal from the judgment of the district court of 
the Second District dismissing the plaintiffs' complaint herein with costs.  

{2} It appears from the evidence that in 1894 the defendant Zeiger, being indebted to 
the defendant the First National Bank of Albuquerque in upwards of the sum of $ 
38,000, was pressed by the bank for a reduction of his indebtedness. Zeiger sought to 
borrow money on his ranch property in New Mexico and Arizona and cattle and other 
available assets, in order to make payment {*183} on his indebtedness to the bank, but 
was unable to do so. He advised Flournoy, the vice president of the bank to this effect, 
and inquired if Flournoy knew of any one who could help him. Flournoy advised Zeiger 
that he thought Mrs. Lesguereux might make him a loan, as she had money in the 
hands of her kinsman, the president of the bank, for investment. Thereupon it was 
arranged with the president of the bank that Mrs. Lesguereux would lend Zeiger the 
sum of $ 15,000, to be secured by deed of trust of certain lands then owned by Zeiger. 
The deed of trust was executed by Zeiger, on October 26, 1894, to the president of the 
bank, as trustee of Mrs. Lesguereux, and the $ 15,000 passed to Zeiger's account at the 
bank, and he applied the same, by his check, in reduction of his indebtedness to the 
bank. Mrs. Lesguereux had no personal knowledge of the loan made to Zeiger, her 
money being in the hands of Raynolds, the president of the bank, for investment, as she 
resided in Boston.  

{3} On April 7, 1895, Zeiger made a general assignment for the benefit of his creditors. 
This action was begun May 11, 1895, and within six months after the deed of trust was 
recorded. The complaint set forth that the deed was an act and device done and 
resorted to by Zeiger in contemplation of insolvency, and was made with a design to 
prefer the defendant bank to the exclusion in part of the plaintiffs and Zeiger's other 
creditors, and that it was not made in good faith, to secure any debt or liability created 



 

 

simultaneously therewith, but for the use and benefit of the defendant bank on account 
of a pre-existing indebtedness of Zeiger to the bank, and that Zeiger never actually 
received from Mrs. Lesguereux the $ 15,000, or any part of it. Answers were filed by the 
First National Bank of Albuquerque, by Joshua S. Raynolds, and Mrs. Lesguereux, 
denying these allegations.  

{4} The issues joined were referred to a master in chancery, to take the testimony in the 
case and to report the same with his findings of fact and law. This order {*184} of 
reference was made by the court over the defendants' objection, taken on the ground 
that defendants were entitled to have the cause tried by the court, and upon the further 
ground that it was not a proper case for reference; defendants duly excepted to the 
order of reference as made by the court, and renewed the objection when the cause 
was brought to trial before the master, and the objection was overruled and defendants 
excepted.  

{*187}  

[EDITOR'S NOTE: The page numbers of this document may appear to be out of 
sequence; however, this pagination accurately reflects the pagination of the original 
published documents.]  

OPINION OF THE COURT.  

{5} This is not a case which the court had power to refer to a master to hear, try and 
determine, or to report the evidence with his findings of fact and conclusions of law, 
except upon the written consent of the parties. Code of Civil Procedure (Compiled Laws 
of 1897, sec. 2685, sub-sec. 138, 139). Terpening v. Holton, 9 Colo. 306, 12 P. 189, in 
which the court, said: "Whether the order therefor be construed as directing the referee 
to try the issues and report a judgment, or to report a finding of fact which would have 
the effect of a special verdict, viewed as a compulsory order, it was issued without 
lawful authority for either purpose, and in such case a valid judgment could not be 
rendered or entered upon the report." Citing Bonner v. McPhail, 31 Barb. 106; Scudder 
v. Snow, 29 How. Pr. 95.  

{6} The defendants having objected to the reference at the time it was made by the 
court, and there being no right of appeal, and this objection having been renewed when 
the trial was moved before the master, the defendants were not bound by the findings of 
the master, nor were such findings in any view conclusive on the court. Kimberly v. 
Arms, 129 U.S. 512 at 512-524, 32 L. Ed. 764, 9 S. Ct. 355. In this case the court said: 
"It is not within the general province of a master to pass upon all the issues in an equity 
case, nor is it competent for the court to refer the entire decision of a case to him 
without the consent of the parties. It can not, of its own motion, or upon the request of 
one party abdicate its duty to determine by its own judgment the controversy presented, 
and devolve that duty upon any of its officers." In Palethorp v. Palethorp, 184 Pa. 585, 
39 A. 489 at 489-90, it is said: "We can not {*188} consider a decree made under such 
circumstances as an adjudication upon any question to which it relates. The 



 

 

appointment of the master was a simple nullity. The decree resting on his report has 
absolutely nothing to support it, and it is therefore a nullity. . . . It may be said that the 
defendants are in no position to raise this question now because of their appearance 
before and recognition of the master as an officer of the court, and that as this case has 
been heard on the testimony, the result ought not now to be disturbed. But it had not 
been heard before any one having the right to hear it. Moreover, if we are to give to the 
mistakes of parties, or to the intentional disregard of our orders, the force and efficacy of 
regularity and law, what will become of our rules of practice?" The court was justified in 
disregarding the findings of fact and conclusions of law, and examining the evidence as 
though that only had been reported by the master. Medler v. H. & O. H. Co., 6 N.M. 331, 
28 P. 551. In this case it is said: "However, the majority of the court do not so interpret 
the case before us, but consider it simply as a partial reference under the powers of the 
chancellor, and as such, that the findings of fact of the master can be measured, if 
necessary, solely by an inquiry into the weight of the evidence. That being the law in 
this Territory, it is plain that the chancellor in the lower court committed no error in 
refusing to give any weight to the findings of facts by the master, but was justified in 
considering the testimony as though it was originally heard by himself." And further, 
"The question is now presented, however, what, if any, weight is to be given the findings 
of the master as to facts when the chancellor has found differently than he had? It would 
seem inevitable from the foregoing holding that the findings of the master must in such 
a case be entirely repudiated, and that we can only consider the testimony and the 
findings, if any, of the chancellor. But what weight is to be given the findings of the 
chancellor? The reason usually advanced for giving so much {*189} weight to the 
findings of a master -- that he heard the witnesses, and beheld their demeanor upon the 
stand -- does not apply to the case of the chancellor. Why, then, should any weight be 
given to his determination? Ought not this court, having all the evidence before it, as did 
the chancellor, pass upon it, unbiased by any presumption or weight growing out of the 
chancellor's findings? The court think not, but consider that we should give some weight 
to the findings of the chancellor, and not reverse those findings unless clearly opposed 
to the evidence."  

{7} The first finding of the master is to the effect that in October, 1894, Zeiger was 
insolvent, and so continued until his assignment, and knew that he was insolvent. The 
defendants excepted to this finding on the ground that there was no evidence tending to 
prove that Zeiger knew he was insolvent in 1894, or at any other time before this 
assignment. The court sustained this exception.  

{8} The only evidence as to Zeiger's insolvency, and his knowledge on the subject 
previous to his assignment, is given by the witness Geach. This witness states that for 
three years prior to the assignment he had been managing the wholesale liquor house 
belonging to Zeiger; that he knew very closely Zeiger's financial condition, and that for 
six months prior to the assignment Zeiger was not solvent. This witness, when asked 
upon cross-examination if it was not his opinion and he had not within six months prior 
to the assignment made statements on Zeiger's behalf showing that he was solvent, 
stated in answer that he could not say, that he did not remember. The evidence shows 
that Zeiger had five or six thousand head of cattle at the end of 1893. These were 



 

 

largely disposed of, or were lost by reason of drought, between that time and 
December, 1894. For six months prior to the assignment, Geach testified that Zeiger 
was engaged in the wholesale and retail liquor business and restaurant and other minor 
interests, and {*190} that during this period he was engaged in closing out his cattle 
business. Raynolds testified that at the time the deed of trust was made the bulk of 
Zeiger's estate was supposed to be in cattle, and that at that time Zeiger was supposed 
to have between four and five thousand head of cattle. He further testified that it had 
always been his understanding that the cause of Zeiger's failure was a loss of fifty to 
seventy-five thousand dollars in cattle. He himself claimed to have lost a hundred 
thousand dollars.  

{9} This is all the testimony upon the subject of Zeiger's insolvency at the time of the 
making of the deed of trust, or of his knowledge that he was insolvent at that time. It 
does not seem that any fair analysis of this testimony would justify the conclusion that 
Zeiger was insolvent at the time of the making of the deed of trust, or that he knew that 
he was insolvent at that time, or that the deed of trust was made in contemplation of 
insolvency with a design to give an undue preference to some of his creditors. Geach's 
testimony does not show insolvency at the time of the making of the deed of trust. He 
would not say that it was not his opinion that Zeiger was solvent within six months prior 
to the assignment, nor could he remember whether or not he had made statements 
within that time showing that Zeiger was in a solvent condition. There is absolutely no 
evidence that Zeiger had any knowledge that he was insolvent at the time the deed of 
trust was made, nor is the evidence such as to justify the conclusion that he must have 
known at the time that he was insolvent. The bank continued to loan him money from 
time to time, to the extent, of fifty-five hundred dollars, up to March 1895, the 
assignment being made on the seventh of April following. The burden was on the 
plaintiff to prove affirmatively these facts as alleged. This they have failed to do. The 
ruling of the court was therefore correct in sustaining the exception of the defendants as 
{*191} there was not sufficient evidence to sustain the first finding of fact as found by the 
master.  

{10} In McDonald, Receiver, v. Chemical National Bank, 174 U.S. 610, 43 L. Ed. 1106, 
19 S. Ct. 787, it is said: "Nor can a finding that the payments and remittances made to 
the Chemical National Bank on the dates above mentioned were made in contemplation 
of insolvency and with an intent to prefer that bank, be based on the mere allegation 
that the Capital National Bank was actually insolvent, and that its insolvency must have 
been known to its officers. It is a matter of common knowledge that banks and other 
corporations continue, in many instances, to do their regular and ordinary business for 
long periods, though in a condition of actual insolvency, as disclosed by subsequent 
events. It can not surely be said that all payments made in due course of business in 
such cases are to be deemed to be made in contemplation of insolvency, or with a view 
to prefer one creditor to another. There is often the hope that, if only the credit of the 
bank can be kept up by continuing its ordinary business, and by avoiding any act of 
insolvency, affairs may take a favorable turn, and thus suspension of payment and of 
business, be avoided."  



 

 

{11} The eighteenth finding of the master is to the effect that the deed of trust was not 
made in good faith to secure a debt created simultaneously therewith. The defendants 
excepted to this finding, on the ground that there was no evidence whatever tending to 
support the finding. The court sustained this exception.  

{12} The transaction leading up to the making and delivery of the deed of trust seems to 
be in the ordinary course of business; Zeiger was indebted to the bank, and was being 
pressed for payment in part at least of his indebtedness. He sought to raise some 
money on his ranch property and cattle, but was unable to do so. He learned that 
Raynolds, the president of the bank, had money to loan for his kinswoman, Mrs. 
Lesguereux. She resided in Boston. The loan was negotiated with Raynolds, the {*192} 
trustee of Mrs. Lesguereux, and the deed of trust was executed to him as her trustee, 
and the amount loaned, $ 15,000, was passed to Zeiger's account, and he, by check, 
paid the money on his indebtedness to the bank, thereby reducing his line of discounts 
by that amount. At this time Zeiger was in active business, and had a wholesale and 
retail liquor business, and, as Raynolds testified, was supposed to have between four 
and five thousand head of cattle. It will not be contended that if Zeiger had procured the 
loan from some party unknown to the bank, that a mortgage or deed of trust given 
therefor would not be a valid security, irrespective of what Zeiger did with the money, 
and it could not be successfully contended that because Zeiger paid the money to the 
bank and subsequently became insolvent, under the conditions contended for by the 
plaintiffs herein, that the mortgage would thereby be affected. The indebtedness to Mrs. 
Lesguereux was certainly concurrent with the execution of the deed of trust. Raynolds, 
as her trustee, had a right to loan her money to Zeiger; he considered the loan a good 
one, and the fact that Mrs. Lesguereux had no knowledge of the transaction can not be 
taken to militate against it. She lived in Boston. Raynolds was a relative, and her money 
was in his hands for investment under general authority to make all loans.  

{13} We are, therefore, of the opinion that the deed of trust was made to secure a debt 
created simultaneously therewith, and that it clearly comes within the exceptions of the 
statute, wherein it is declared that nothing in the act shall affect any mortgage, in good 
faith to secure a debt created simultaneously with such mortgage. The court below was 
therefore correct in sustaining the eleventh exception of the defendants to the 
eighteenth finding of the master, wherein he found that the deed of trust was not made 
in good faith to secure a debt created simultaneously therewith.  

{14} We see no error in the court sustaining the defendant's {*193} exception to the 
seventh finding of fact, wherein he finds that the sum of $ 15,000 was charged on the 
books of the bank to Mrs. Lesguereux, and the sum of $ 15,000 credited on the same 
books to Zeiger, who went through the form of giving the bank a check for that sum.  

{15} The undisputed evidence of Zeiger on this question is to the effect that he obtained 
the money by giving a mortgage to Mrs. Lesguereux, or her trustee, on the Zeiger 
ranch; that the money was placed to his credit in the First National Bank, and with that 
money he liquidated a portion of his indebtedness to the bank by checking against his 
account. There can be no question that Zeiger received the money from Mrs. 



 

 

Lesguereux, through her trustee, to whom the deed of trust was made, and that he 
applied the money in part to payment of his indebtedness to the bank. Upon the whole 
case we sustain the decision of the court below, to the effect that the making and 
delivery of the deed of trust by Zeiger was not in contemplation of insolvency and with a 
design to prefer the defendant bank to the exclusion of the plaintiffs and other creditors; 
that it was made in good faith to secure a debt created simultaneously therewith, and 
comes within the exceptions of the statute; that Zeiger was not insolvent, and did not 
know, nor have reason to know, that he was insolvent at the time of the making and 
delivery of said deed of trust; that Zeiger received the $ 15,000 from Mrs. Lesguereux, 
through her trustee, to whom the deed of trust was executed and delivered by him, and 
that he applied such sum in liquidation of a portion of his indebtedness to the bank.  

{16} It therefore becomes unnecessary to examine critically any of the other exceptions 
and assignments of error set forth in the record. If we are correct in these conclusions, it 
follows that the judgment of the court below, dismissing the plaintiffs' bill of complaint, 
must be affirmed. And it is so ordered.  


